
 

 

 
PARTNER HOSPITAL & PROVIDERS 

 

The Brooklyn 
Hospital Center 

 

121 DeKalb Avenue 
Brooklyn, NY 11201 

 
 

Labor and Delivery Unit Phone: 
718-250-8400 

 
Website: 

 https://www.tbh.org/ 
 
 
Note: Mother and Baby Unit tours and 
classes are indefinitely postponed due 

to the COVID-19 pandemic.  

Dr. Erwin Lerebours, MD 

ACPNY Office Locations: Crown Heights and Kings Highway 

Languages: English, Creole, French, Spanish 

 

Dr. Lerebours is an OB/GYN at the Crown Heights and 

Kings Highway Medical Offices. He attended medical 

school at the University of Haiti, and completed 

residencies at Harlem Hospital and Rochester General 

Hospital. 

 

 

Dr. Yevgeniya Osipova, DO 

ACPNY Office Locations: Bay Ridge and Crown Heights 

Languages: English, Ukrainian, Russian 

 

Dr. Osipova graduated from the New York Institute of 

Technology, College of Osteopathic Medicine, and 

completed her residency at Richmond University 

Medical Center in Staten Island. In addition to general 

obstetrics, she has a special interest in laparoscopy, 

and has published in some of the most prestigious 

journals in that specialty, including the American 

Journal of Obstetrics and Gynecology.  

 

 

 
 
 
 
 

AdvantageCare 
Physicians 
 

Phone: 

646-680-4227 
 

Website: 

acpny.com  
 
At AdvantageCare Physicians 
(ACPNY), we offer 
comprehensive “whole you” 
obstetrics care. That approach 
means our obstetricians will 
collaborate with your Primary 
Care Provider and other 
specialists to make sure we’re 
considering all of the physical, 
mental, and lifestyle factors that 
contribute to your entire health 
picture.  
 
You can rest assured that your 
Care Team will get to know you 
and collaborate on providing 
care tailored to your individual 
needs. And, our myACPNY 
patient portal provides access to 
your medical records and care 
history no matter which office 
you visit. 

https://www.tbh.org/
http://www.acpny.com/

